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FOREWORD

Any significant homeland response event requires 
Americans to work together. This has proven to be a 
complex challenge. Our response capabilities, while 
substantial, are spread across thousands of stakehold-
ers: federal, state, and local government agencies and 
organizations, nongovernmental organizations, and 
private industry. No single actor has all the necessary 
tools to respond completely to a major crisis. Despite 
considerable national effort and resources devoted to 
planning, training, integrating, and improving our 
homeland response capabilities, effectiveness in work-
ing together—unity of effort—still seems to elude us. 
Achieving unity of effort is difficult even in simple 
situations. It becomes increasingly complicated when 
it involves dozens or even hundreds of participants 
in a federal system such as ours, where responsibility 
and capability are distributed across many levels and 
functions. Finding ways to synergize a broad range of 
responsible participants is the central challenge to ef-
fective homeland response operations. 

In this monograph, H Steven Blum and Kerry Mc-
Intyre argue that the problem of achieving unity of ef-
fort in homeland response is not one of poor planning 
or inadequate resources, but rather more fundamental. 
It involves the way in which thousands of participants 
from dissimilar professional cultures think about their 
roles and responsibilities for homeland response. To 
address this problem, Blum and McIntyre propose a 
broadly construed national doctrine, developed in a 
dynamic and responsive doctrine-producing system. 
They cite the example of joint military doctrine, which 
attained its contemporary robust state and authorita-
tive impact only through changes implemented as a re-



sult of the Goldwater-Nichols Act. The joint doctrine- 
producing system that arose from Goldwater-Nichols 
remedied many shortcomings, such as enforcing con-
gruity between individual service and joint doctrine, 
identifying and addressing capability gaps, and incor-
porating the requirements of field commanders. The 
authors contend that a dynamic national homeland 
response doctrine, developed in a truly inclusive na-
tional system, would have a similar effect in syner-
gizing national capabilities. They propose a doctrinal 
system that develops and implements operational 
concepts, plans, and training programs.  The concepts 
are thoroughly tested in realistic exercises and actual 
operations.  The plans, operations, and training pro-
grams are then systematically analyzed to inform and 
update evolving doctrinal concepts, which ultimately 
influence the organization, training, and equipping of 
response elements.

Blum and McIntyre contend that such a national 
doctrine requires a new management concept, fash-
ioned on the model of the military’s Joint Interagency 
Task Force (JIATF). They argue that this concept has 
broad potential not just in support of military opera-
tions, but any time disparate response organizations 
must work together. They suggest a JIATF-like inter-
agency coordination and action group which could 
operate across and between jurisdictional divides to 
unify not just the federal interagency response, but 
state and perhaps local interagency efforts as well. In 
developing this idea, they outline some of the critical 
functions this element should perform.

Finally, the authors address the problem of en-
suring that our military’s available “dual capable” 
forces—active and reserve—are contributing to unity 
of effort in homeland response. They discuss the na-
scent potential of dual-status command, the artificial 
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impediment posed by the division of forces into sepa-
rate legal statuses under Title 10 and Title 32, and the 
possibility of a civil support force generation model 
to improve predictability in providing available capa-
bilities for homeland response.

		

		  DOUGLAS C. LOVELACE, JR.
		  Director
		  Strategic Studies Institute 
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SUMMARY

Balancing authorities and responsibilities within 
our federal system has been a matter of continuous 
debate since the earliest days of the republic. Its con-
tinued relevance is exemplified in our current national 
conversation over how to most effectively organize 
and operate for homeland security and defense. Cri-
ses and catastrophic events in our homeland require 
Americans from different organizations, jurisdictions, 
and functions to work together. Yet despite consider-
able national effort and resources devoted to devel-
oping and improving our collective response capa-
bilities, effectiveness in working together—unity of 
effort—still seems to elude us.

Achieving unity of effort is the central challenge 
to effective homeland response operations. No single 
organization, function, or stakeholder has all the nec-
essary tools to respond completely to the wide range 
of crises that routinely occur, or could occur, in our 
homeland. Combining the assets, capabilities, exper-
tise, and resources of multiple participants has proven 
to be exceedingly complex and difficult. Our home-
land response capabilities are considerable, but they 
are dispersed across a patchwork of jurisdictions and 
functions. The challenge in homeland response opera-
tions is neither inadequate resources nor lack of capa-
bilities, but rather in being able to bring them to bear 
at the right time and place, and in the right combina-
tion. Disasters in our homeland have enormous con-
sequences. Regardless of cause or extent, they always 
hold the potential for significant loss of life, human 
suffering, economic dislocation, and erosion of public 
confidence in government. Given all that is at stake, 
we must do better. There are certainly a number of 



ways to improve our results; this monograph propos-
es three specific ways to do so.

First, enhancing our capacity for unity of effort 
requires more than simply devoting more resources 
and rhetoric to the problem. The challenge is more 
fundamental; it requires us to change the way we 
think about homeland response in order to establish 
the intellectual pre-conditions for unified effort. Cre-
ating this cultural shift requires a national homeland 
response doctrine, formulated in a dynamic and re-
sponsive doctrinal system. Doctrine performs a vital 
unifying function in complex operations. It delineates 
best practices, establishes standards, and clarifies ter-
minology, responsibilities, and procedures. It creates 
common understandings, bridging organizational 
and jurisdictional divides. 

A nascent federal homeland response doctrine cur-
rently exists, codified in the National Response Frame-
work (NRF), National Incident Management System 
(NIMS), and Incident Command System (ICS). Yet, a 
doctrinal system is larger than the doctrine itself. It 
operates in a dynamic cycle, providing a process to 
identify capability gaps, develop new operating con-
cepts, and validate them against rigorous standards. 
An effective doctrinal system also incorporates all 
relevant stakeholders in the full cycle of concept de-
velopment, validation, and integration into plans and 
procedures. Current homeland response doctrine is 
a federal, not national doctrine. A unifying national 
doctrine, engendered in a dynamic and responsive 
system, would provide the basis for developing a na-
tional culture of communication and cooperation in 
homeland response operations. 

A second way to enhance our capacity for unity of 
effort is to ensure that national doctrine can be broad-
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ly implemented. A truly national homeland response 
doctrine system will function in an interagency, in-
tergovernmental, multi-jurisdictional environment. 
Implementing it requires a new management struc-
ture that can also operate in the spaces between agen-
cies and governments. The example of the military’s 
Joint Interagency Task Force (JIATF) points the way 
toward this new structure. A permanent interagency 
coordination and action group, which integrates in-
puts, resources, and capabilities of all stakeholders, 
can synergize and coordinate the efforts of all. Such 
a structure clearly has an application at federal, state, 
and perhaps even local level, as each has a complex 
interagency framework to manage in order to fully 
integrate response capabilities. To be effective, this 
structure cannot be subordinate to any single agency 
or function; it must be responsive to all stakeholders 
and accountable to an elected leader with authority 
over the interagency effort.

A third way to enhance unity of effort is to remove 
barriers to employment of military capabilities for 
homeland response operations. There are clear legal 
restrictions on the roles and uses of our military at 
home, which exist for sound reasons. Yet much of our 
military can be characterized as “dual capable,” de-
scribing forces with inherent capabilities useful both 
for warfighting and for civil support tasks. It makes 
little difference to the injured, hungry, and dispos-
sessed that the soldier who rescued them is a National 
Guardsman, a Title 10 reservist, or an active duty ser-
vice member. Their reasonable expectation is that the 
forces raised and sustained with their tax dollars will 
provide for their safety when needed. For this rea-
son, we should be removing impediments to utilizing 
our military forces—particularly our reserve compo-
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nents—for homeland response operations when they 
are not engaged in other federal missions. This is not a 
matter of apportioning different forces to the National 
Guard. Rather, it is one of determining when and how 
any relevant military capabilities should be placed 
under a governor’s authority for civil support roles. 
The recent development of the concept of dual status 
command is a step forward in this regard. Develop-
ment of a predictable civil support force generation 
model, similar to the one employed by the services for 
federal missions overseas, will further enhance unity 
of effort by facilitating planning among the states for 
temporary use of dual status military capabilities.

Achieving unity of effort in homeland response is a 
complex challenge, among the greatest of our age. It is 
the single most important factor in our ability to plan 
for and respond effectively to disasters at home. We 
devote enormous resources to public safety and secu-
rity at many levels. Our citizens surely have a right to 
expect that these resources will be well used by their 
leaders, elected and appointed. This means that we 
must find better ways to work together. It requires 
leaders and organizations at all levels to combine their 
efforts, resources, and capabilities to achieve complete 
and responsive solutions. It requires us to develop 
new ways of thinking about and managing homeland 
response capabilities, before disaster strikes. 
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ENABLING UNITY OF EFFORT
IN HOMELAND RESPONSE OPERATIONS

Who is likely to make suitable provisions for the pub-
lic defense, as that body to which the guardianship of 
the public safety is confided . . . which, by the exten-
sion of its authority throughout the States, can alone 
establish uniformity and concert in the plans and mea-
sures by which the common safety is to be secured?

		  —Alexander Hamilton,
		  Federalist Paper No. 23

Questions about achieving unity of effort in our 
public policy, and the balance of authority and respon-
sibility between various levels of government, are as 
old as the republic. They have enormous contempo-
rary relevance, particularly in the national debate over 
how we organize and act to secure the safety of our 
citizens and interests at home. We believe that achiev-
ing unity of effort is the central challenge to effective 
homeland response operations. Despite all the effort 
and considerable resources devoted to improving our 
capabilities, effectiveness in working together—unity 
of effort—still seems to elude us. In many disaster 
situations, including the largest and most dangerous, 
the ability to field a seamless, unified, robust response 
from our enormously capable mix of local, state, and 
federal government and private sector entities is still 
out of reach. This monograph examines how we might 
change our current organization and doctrine today 
to achieve a more effective response. For simplicity, 
the term “homeland response” is used to encompass 
all facets of planning, preparing, and resourcing for; 
directly responding to; and mitigating and recover-
ing from, the broad spectrum of catastrophic events 



2

in the American homeland, ranging from natural to 
man-made disasters, industrial accidents, pandemic 
disease, terrorist attacks, and similar events. 

Why Unity of Effort?

Any significant homeland response event re-
quires Americans to work together. Doing so can 
be a complex challenge. Our nation has enormous 
resources and vast capacity available to it, but these 
are spread across a patchwork of jurisdictions, agen-
cies, and authorities. No single organization, function, 
or stakeholder has all the necessary tools to respond 
completely to a major crisis, let alone many smaller 
ones. Combining the assets, capabilities, expertise, 
organizations, and resources of multiple participants 
is extremely difficult. This should be unsurprising; 
achieving unity of effort is difficult even for structur-
ally similar, well-resourced entities operating under 
unified command—such as our military. It becomes 
increasingly complicated when it involves dozens 
or even hundreds of participants in a federal system 
such as ours, where responsibility and capability are 
distributed across many levels and functions. At each 
level of government, homeland response must com-
bine planners and responders with diverse organiza-
tional cultures operating under separate authorities 
and differing, even divergent, operational require-
ments and objectives. 

In normal times, the distribution and balancing 
of power in our federal system are a considerable 
strength, a crucial element in the vitality and respon-
siveness of our democracy. However, the multitude 
of threats we face in our homeland are not confined 
to the capabilities of a single function, nor within the 
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bounds of geography or jurisdiction; both prepared-
ness and response are complicated by the “seams” 
in our system. In his seminal work On War, Carl Von 
Clausewitz wrote that in war even the simplest things 
are difficult, and that “difficulties accumulate . . . pro-
ducing a kind of friction.” This friction is an impedi-
ment that “makes the apparently easy so difficult.”1 
Just as in warfare, a kind of Clausewitzian friction is 
quite obviously at work in every homeland response 
situation, in every crisis which demands collective 
action. The diffusion of authorities and capabilities 
across multiple agencies, organizations, and levels of 
government, coupled with the sheer size and complex-
ity of the nation, creates an unavoidable friction that 
makes the simplest operations difficult and achieving 
unity of effort a daunting challenge.

Solving any problem must begin with defining it. 
Our homeland response problem is not one of insuffi-
cient resources. We spend billions, possibly more than 
any other nation, on homeland response. It is not one 
of individual assets. We have highly developed medi-
cal, police, fire, transportation, logistics, communica-
tions, military, and other emergency response capabil-
ities. The problem at its heart is not lacking resources 
and capabilities, but in being unable to bring them to 
bear at the right time and place, and in the right com-
bination, to achieve effective results. It is the inability 
to integrate a vast array of systems and elements into 
a seamless, coordinated response. Combining what 
each stakeholder brings to the table requires coopera-
tion, communication, collaboration, and coordination. 
These are the most important factors in homeland re-
sponse—they are the key to achieving unity of effort. 
Without them, effective response is impossible. 
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Some recent and well-known major disasters illus-
trate the problem. Nuclear disasters elicit particularly 
grave concern because of their potential for large-
scale human suffering and extremely long-term con-
sequences. On April 26, 1986, the Chernobyl nuclear 
reactor in the former Soviet Republic of Ukraine expe-
rienced a disastrous explosion resulting from a combi-
nation of poor design and human error. While not an 
American catastrophe, Chernobyl affected people in 
many nations. It demonstrated clearly that problems 
with unity of effort are not unique to our system; the 
potential exists anytime multiple organizations and 
jurisdictions have to work together. It also shows the 
broad (even international) consequences of ineffective 
disaster response. 

Soviet authorities tried to prevent news of it from 
reaching the rest of the world even as they struggled 
to respond to the crisis. The first notification came 
from radiation detectors at a Swedish nuclear facility 
more than 600 miles from the Chernobyl plant.2 First 
responders desperately undertook suicidal efforts to 
control the fire, using inadequate equipment and tech-
niques. The resulting cloud of radioactive material 
spread over much of Europe. Soviet attempts to hide 
the nature and extent of the problem overshadowed 
and hampered their internal response and precluded 
timely assistance from potential international part-
ners, even as it put populations across their country 
and the region at risk. Ad hoc response and poorly 
coordinated efforts exacerbated the consequences of 
what is commonly acknowledged to be the worst di-
saster in the history of the nuclear industry.3 Despite 
the bravery of those at the scene, both planning and 
response were ineffective; and the consequences of 
the disaster will continue to challenge the Ukrainian 
government and many others for decades to come.
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On September 11, 2001 (9/11), terrorist cells of the 
al Qaeda network hijacked four commercial airlin-
ers. They flew two of them into the twin towers of the 
World Trade Center in New York. A third plane was 
used to attack the Pentagon in Arlington, Virginia, 
and the fourth crashed outside of Shanksville, Penn-
sylvania. Using comparatively low technology, a de-
termined enemy was able to strike a substantial blow 
within the U.S. homeland. Nearly 3,000 people were 
killed, the largest single loss of life to foreign attack on 
American soil in the nation’s history.4 In the immedi-
ate crisis, authorities struggled to obtain an accurate 
picture of the situation, share information between 
agencies, and determine how to coordinate govern-
ment efforts to respond to the attacks.5 In the days and 
weeks that followed, senior leaders had extreme diffi-
culty coordinating the vast resources and capabilities 
of the nation to mitigate and recover from the attacks, 
anticipate and prevent additional attacks, and de-
velop an appropriate response.6 Air Force planes flew 
combat patrols over the nation’s cities and National 
Guardsmen patrolled the airports. Congress hastily 
debated and passed the USA PATRIOT Act. State and 
local governments desperately tried to evaluate their 
vulnerabilities and to protect the public and private 
assets in their jurisdictions. Substantial reorganiza-
tions in the federal government were quickly initi-
ated. A new cabinet-level Department of Homeland 
Security was created by combining 22 federal agen-
cies. The Department of Defense (DoD) established a 
new combatant command (U.S. Northern Command) 
to manage homeland defense, and created a new po-
sition with the title of Assistant Secretary of Defense 
for Homeland Defense and America’s Security Af-
fairs (ASD-HDASA). These changes were generally 
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necessary and prudent, but unity of effort cannot be 
attained by simply redrawing a line and block chart. 
Unfortunately, some of these organizational changes 
had the unintended consequence of making unity of 
effort more difficult. Despite all the restructuring of 
agencies and refocusing of resources, many still ques-
tion whether the nation is truly safer or better pre-
pared for the next terrorist strike.7

Four years later, on August 29, 2005, Hurricane 
Katrina struck the Gulf Coast of Louisiana and Mis-
sissippi. The initial effects of the storm, coupled with 
levee failures in New Orleans, caused widespread 
devastation and flooding. Over the ensuing weeks, 
poor information sharing, lack of coordination, and 
politically-motivated bickering delayed a unified re-
sponse, and thereby exacerbated the suffering of the 
affected population.8 After Hurricane Katrina, another 
congressional inquiry detailed the causes and results 
of the most expensive natural disaster in U.S. history.9 
Despite massive national efforts over the preceding 4 
years to reorganize, refocus, and better prepare, the 
congressional inquiry noted a lack of initiative, coop-
erative effort, effective communication, and situation-
al awareness. Once again, unity of effort eluded us. 

More recently, a large man-made disaster struck 
the same region. On April 20, 2010, a British Petro-
leum (BP) deep-water oil-drilling platform in the Gulf 
of Mexico known as Deepwater Horizon suffered a 
catastrophic explosion, sinking the rig. Eleven crew 
members lost their lives, and the damaged well spilled 
crude oil into the Gulf of Mexico as BP, its partners, 
the scientific and technical communities, and govern-
ment leaders at all levels struggled to find ways to cap 
the well and contain the massive spill. The involve-
ment of a major foreign-owned multinational corpora-
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tion further complicated the situation. Over the next 3 
months, the well discharged an estimated five million 
barrels of oil into the gulf, constituting the largest acci-
dental oil spill in history and resulting in widespread 
ecological and economic distress that is being felt to 
this day.10 While analyses are still being written, one 
might easily conclude that failure to achieve unity of 
effort reduced the effectiveness of the response, miti-
gation, and recovery efforts. 

These major catastrophes differ in many of their 
particulars. Some mishaps that were preventable oc-
curred; some that were unavoidable were made worse 
by human error, mechanical failures, procedural laps-
es, and poor information sharing. This monograph 
will not discuss in-depth postmortems on any of these 
disasters, as such. Rather, it provides recent and well-
known examples of a common problem in disaster 
planning and response. Each crisis was characterized 
by multiple failures among the participants to work 
together effectively. Leaders charged with planning 
and managing the response failed to achieve unity of 
effort. They were less effective than they needed to be, 
and the loss of life, human suffering, and other long-
term negative consequences were accordingly made 
considerably worse.

Disasters in our homeland have enormous conse-
quences. Regardless of their cause, size, and scope, 
they always hold the potential for significant loss of 
life, human suffering, economic dislocation, and ero-
sion of public confidence in our government and our 
leaders. Given what is at stake, we must do better. The 
findings of many investigatory committees and blue 
ribbon commissions underscore a broad consensus 
that there are substantial impediments to unity of ef-
fort and effective response. Such findings inform the 
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ongoing national conversation on this topic, as well 
they should. This monograph proposes three recom-
mendations for improving our capacity for unified ef-
fort in homeland response operations. Certainly there 
are other ways to enhance and synergize our response 
capabilities, but we believe these proposals merit care-
ful consideration. 

First, to be consistently effective, we must create 
a culture of collaboration and cooperation. We must 
establish the intellectual pre-conditions for unified ef-
fort by changing the way we think about homeland 
response. Creating an operating culture that fosters 
unity of effort requires a national homeland response 
doctrine, formulated in a dynamic and responsive doc-
trinal system. Our military forces and our national fire- 
fighting entity have such systems. The military’s joint 
doctrine development system grew out of the legis-
lative mandate of the Goldwater-Nichols Act,11 while 
national fire doctrine has developed under the Na-
tional Fire Administration, established in response to 
shortcomings identified in the 1973 report of the Na-
tional Commission on Fire Prevention and Control.12 
However, the comprehensive doctrinal systems they 
have developed are not replicated to the same degree 
across the wider homeland response community. 

More important, there is no single national doctri-
nal system that covers all functions and stakeholders. 
To be clear, there is published federal doctrine embod-
ied in the National Response Framework (NRF), the 
National Incident Management System (NIMS), and 
the Incident Command System (ICS). Publication of 
these documents was a substantial step forward. But 
what is missing is far more important. Doctrine is dy-
namic; it is evolutionary. To be effective, it must devel-
op within a common system, through a standardized 
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process incorporating the inputs of all stakeholders as 
a timely response to the lessons of realistic training 
and operational experience. We propose that such a 
comprehensive doctrinal system is not only possible 
for homeland response, but in fact essential. It is the 
living structure and process through which a culture 
of cooperation and collaboration can be fostered. 

Second, to implement a common national doctrine 
which operates across the many divides in our sys-
tem, we need a new management construct, one that 
operates in the spaces between jurisdictions and func-
tions to integrate and synergize the contributions of 
all. Again, our military has pointed a way forward. 
Several unified commands operate Joint Interagency 
Coordinating Groups (JIACGs) and Joint Interagency 
Task Forces (JIATFs).13 The doctrinal basis for their or-
ganization and functions is slender but growing, and 
their operational effectiveness is well established. The 
results of JIATF-South over the preceding 2 decades, 
for example, provide clear evidence of the value of the 
concept.14 We propose establishing a similar concept 
and rigorously testing it across the range of home-
land response operations. The concept should not be 
a military one, but instead a more broadly construed 
doctrinal model which will evolve over time and en-
compass all elements involved in homeland response 
operations. 

Third, we should remove the barriers to unity of 
effort within our military civil support capabilities. 
This requires that we put in place the authorities and 
doctrine necessary to provide our governors (and the 
President) with the ability to effectively employ DoD 
assets for homeland response. Most of our military—
both active and reserve—contains capabilities with 
strong utility for civil support. Placing them off limits 
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for homeland response is simply counterproductive. 
Our reserve components (RC) are particularly well 
positioned to bear principal responsibility for defense 
support of civil authority (DSCA); they are forward 
deployed across the nation. However, impediments 
to their training, resourcing, readiness, and availabil-
ity for this mission remain. Military capabilities that 
might be useful to a governor should not be withheld 
in time of need, regardless of the command to which 
they are assigned. This requires that we build the au-
thorities and processes necessary to access useful forc-
es and capabilities, when and where they are needed. 
It may entail further modification of Title 32 of the U.S. 
code to permit swift and seamless movement of capa-
bilities into a status accessible to a governor, and will 
certainly require improved procedural mechanisms.15 
Recent steps to clarify and simplify dual status com-
mand structures are a logical step in this direction.16 
We believe that many military capabilities could, un-
der the right circumstances, be available to a governor 
and serve under a qualified dual status commander. 
Additionally, procedures for identifying and prepar-
ing capabilities in advance of catastrophe must be 
developed. DSCA is a complex mission set. Available 
forces should be designated and trained in advance 
if their capabilities are to be fully ready when called. 
States must be able to plan for homeland contingency 
operations with confidence, knowing which military 
capabilities are ready and available, and empowered 
to act decisively to employ them when needed.17

Why National Doctrine?

We must focus first on doctrine to enable unity of 
effort in homeland response. One might observe that 
we already have federal doctrine published by the 
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Department of Homeland Security, that the services 
have joint doctrine for civil support and homeland 
response, and that many elements across the various 
Emergency Support Functions (ESFs)18 have a pub-
lished doctrine. However, it is not the doctrine we 
possess, but rather the doctrine we lack which is at is-
sue. The open questions about our homeland response 
capabilities, including those questions that have yet to 
be asked, must be answered with doctrinal solutions. 
For this to occur, we need a robust national homeland 
response doctrine which is more than a federal doc-
trine, larger than the doctrine of individual response 
functions or joint military civil response doctrine. It 
must subsume, deconflict, and integrate the separate 
doctrines of its members; it must do so responsively 
on a continuing basis. It must draw on the input and 
expertise of all participants, particularly the agencies 
and departments of the states and localities, and other 
nonfederal stakeholders. What currently exists is good 
but not unifying doctrine; and it is a federal doctrine 
only. A unifying national doctrine will incorporate all 
the capabilities of the nation within a single system.

The experience of our military makes a strong case 
for a national homeland response doctrine system. 
Despite organizationally similar cultures, unity of 
command, and strong service doctrine, our military’s 
performance in operations such as the Iranian hostage 
rescue in 1980 and the Grenada intervention in 1983 un-
derscore how difficult it is for complex organizations 
to work together effectively. In contrast, the impres-
sive combat performances in Panama, Kuwait, Iraq, 
and Afghanistan in recent decades, and in many op-
erations short of war in various locations, underscore 
the value of joint doctrine in creating unified effort 
across the services. Yet it took a statutory push—the 
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Goldwater-Nichols Act—to create the joint doctrine 
development system and the body of doctrine our 
military now employs. Prior to that legislation, there 
was no standard process for initiating, coordinating, 
approving, or revising joint doctrine. There was no 
requirement for congruity between joint and service 
doctrine, or for incorporating the requirements of the 
force commanders who had to employ the doctrine. 
There was no way to identify and address conceptual 
voids, and no mechanism for validating the efficacy 
of emerging concepts.19 Our military forces—and the 
nation—paid dearly for the lack of a robust joint doc-
trine over the decades from the end of World War II 
through 1985.20 Yet the military’s joint doctrine system 
is now in place, has matured over the past 25 years, 
and continues to evolve. The benefits for the military 
services are demonstrated by their unrivaled perfor-
mance across a broad range of operational challenges. 
Considering the thousands of disparate stakeholders 
involved in homeland response, it will certainly be 
more difficult to bring this kind of rigor to a national 
doctrinal system. For this very reason, such a system 
is all the more important.

Doctrine performs a vital unifying function in 
complex operations. It delineates “what is taught, 
believed, and advocated as what is right (i.e., what 
works best).” It provides textbook solutions for how 
things should be done to achieve specific results. It 
“standardizes terminology, training, relationships, 
responsibilities, and processes.”21 Prior to Goldwater-
Nichols, the individual services had well-developed 
doctrinal concepts. Each had institutional structures 
for identifying unmet requirements and for updat-
ing and improving their doctrine. For example, the 
Army’s doctrinal revolution following the Vietnam 
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War was an institutional response to perceived new 
strategic challenges. It helped lay the foundation for 
the successes of our land forces over the ensuing 3 
decades.22 Yet individual service doctrine, by defini-
tion, must be subordinate to joint doctrine. To achieve 
common understanding between the services, joint 
doctrine coordinates and integrates service doctri-
nal concepts. It operates across service boundaries 
to unify their approaches to common challenges and 
bind together the ways in which they are addressed. 
Joint doctrine provides the cultural basis for effective 
communication by standardizing terms and formats. 
It enhances coordination by generating and updating 
common tactics, techniques, and procedures (TTPs). It 
promotes collaboration and cooperation by providing 
common ways of thinking about and solving prob-
lems. Doctrine clarifies relationships: who leads and 
who follows, who supports and who is supported. 
Joint doctrine “promotes a common perspective from 
which to plan, train, and conduct military operations 
. . . it guides employment of forces in coordinated and 
integrated action toward a common objective.”23 Joint 
doctrine creates the basis for our military to coopera-
tively produce capabilities far greater than any single 
service can field. In short, despite the commonly ac-
knowledged importance across the services of unity 
of command, it is joint doctrine that has given them 
unity of effort.

Joint military doctrine operates in a dynamic cycle. 
It provides a process through which capability gaps 
are identified. Corresponding operating concepts are 
developed, fielded, and incorporated into operational 
plans and then validated against rigorous standards 
in realistic training and the crucible of real-world ex-
perience. The results are analyzed and used to influ-
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ence the ongoing development of doctrine. Successful 
results support training, organizing, and equipping 
standards. Failures are equally important, driving 
changes to improve doctrinal concepts and standards 
and hopefully future results. But whether success or 
failure, the development of future capabilities, of joint 
operating concepts, and of standards for equipping, 
training, and organizing response elements are dy-
namically affected by the rigorously tested results of 
today’s doctrinal concepts. 

A recent DoD advisory panel on enhancing de-
fense support of civil authority found that “there is 
currently no comprehensive national integrated plan-
ning system to respond to either natural or manmade 
disasters.” Further, “planning among federal agencies 
and other levels of government is fragmented and 
nonstandard, and there is no formal process by which 
state plans can inform federal planning and vice ver-
sa.”24 The panel report asserted that: 

the emergency response community has long under-
stood that the foundation for any effective response to  
a . . . catastrophic incident consists of effective plan-
ning and information sharing before the emergency 
and a coordinated preparation and response activity 
prior to, during, and after the incident.25 

To correct the shortcomings in planning and coordi-
nation processes, they recommended that: 

the President direct the establishment of an integrated 
planning system that promotes coordinated planning 
among local, state, and federal government entities 
and the private sector . . . international organizations 
and friendly and allied governments.26 
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The panel cited a 2003 Homeland Security Presidential 
Directive (HSPD-8) as an appropriate model. Much of 
what HSPD-8 sought to establish looks a lot like a na-
tional homeland response doctrine system. It directed 
the creation of:

•	� A national doctrine and planning guidance, 
instruction, and process to ensure consistent 
planning across the federal government;

•	 A mechanism for concept development;
•	� A process . . . for plan refinement which reflects 

developments in risk, capabilities, and policies, 
and incorporates lessons learned from exercises 
and actual incidents;

•	� A process that links regional, state, local, and 
tribal plans; planning cycles; and processes, 
and allows these plans to inform the develop-
ment of federal plans;

•	� A process for fostering vertical and horizontal 
integration of federal, state, local, and tribal 
plans, and for using assessments of state, local, 
and tribal capabilities to inform the develop-
ment of federal plans; and,

•	� A guide for all-hazards planning, with compre-
hensive, practical guidance and instruction on 
fundamental planning principles that can be 
used at federal, state, local, and tribal levels to 
assist the planning process.27

The objective of HSPD-8 was to create a system 
in which thinking about homeland response among 
federal, state, and local governments comes together 
to create a unified, and unifying, national way of op-
erating—that is, a national doctrine. There is federal 
doctrine, and there are federal exercises and training; 
states and localities also plan and train. However, 
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there is no national point of convergence in our home-
land response thinking. There is no single place where 
differing concepts are understood, de-conflicted, and 
synthesized to create integrated response capabilities. 
There is no unified system to identify capability gaps 
and requirements, develop concepts, solicit input, 
and ensure “buy in” from all stakeholders. There is no 
systematic process to validate national doctrinal con-
cepts in full-scale, realistic exercises, and real-world 
experience, or to integrate them into national plan-
ning. The effect of a robust joint operating doctrine on 
our military has been profound. It would be equally 
profound for our homeland response capabilities. It 
would provide a locus in which common understand-
ings are formed, where common operating concepts 
and principles are analyzed, validated, updated, and 
authoritatively disseminated. 

A National Homeland Response Doctrine System.

A system that dynamically develops a national 
homeland response doctrine for all participants is the 
critical first step to enabling unity of effort. But what 
should this system look like? In general, it should op-
erate like the model depicted in Figure 1. It should cer-
tainly include all of the elements in HSPD-8 outlined 
above. The DoD advisory panel found that the current 
administration had not “reaffirmed, amended, or su-
perseded” HSPD-8, and so they recommended a pres-
idential directive establishing an integrated national 
planning system. Yet, a system founded on executive 
order seems inconsistent with creating the basis for 
unity of effort. The flaw in such a system, of course, 
is that it is a creature of the federal executive branch 
alone. It will extend only as far as the reach of the ex-
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ecutive branch and last as long as a President directs. 
Presidential orders also lack specific and long-term 
funding, hampering their implementation beyond the 
executive branch. 

Figure 1. Theoretical Model of the
National Homeland Response Doctrinal Cycle.

A truly national system must be based on more 
than executive fiat, and must endure beyond the next 
election cycle. It is important to start somewhere, and 
a presidential directive may be a useful starting point. 
Certainly, it could enable a doctrinal system to be 
established more quickly. But in the end, just as the 
armed forces needed the legislative spur of the Gold-
water-Nichols Act to develop a true joint doctrine 
system, so a national homeland response doctrinal 
system will require a legislative impetus to be endur-
ing, to be properly resourced and fully reflective of the 
broad mix of interests at stake. Just as important, this 
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system must be larger than the federal government. In 
our democratic system, responsibility and authority 
are balanced. Our homeland response is graduated, 
beginning at the local level and progressively draw-
ing upon the higher-level resources and capabilities 
needed to address the challenge. In this system, under 
most circumstances the federal government can lead, 
facilitate, incorporate, integrate . . . but not dictate. 
Consequently, it must include—as equal partners—
the states, localities, and others. A congressional 
mandate would provide the kind of broad national 
representation that is needed. The executive branch 
could undertake both kinds of actions, initially issu-
ing a presidential directive to the various executive 
branch departments even as legislation is developed 
to create a more lasting system. However, a national 
doctrine system will be enduring only if it is broadly 
construed, has a basis in federal law, and is adequately 
resourced. Most important, it must include more than 
federal government entities and equities.

Properly established, a national homeland re-
sponse doctrinal system will incorporate a senior 
body of elected and appointed federal, state, and local 
officials who will validate requirements and emerging 
strategic operating concepts. Including representation 
from states, localities, and other players that must be 
a part of a national system will ensure their buy-in 
and cooperation. Operating below this senior level 
should be a set of institutional bodies which identify 
capability gaps and requirements, develop draft doc-
trinal concepts, present them for validation, and, once 
validated, fully develop and implement them as inter-
agency and/or intergovernmental components of the 
national doctrine. This subordinate structure should 
also include regular representation and input from 
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all members of the homeland response community. 
National doctrine should begin with and build upon 
the NRF, NIMS, and ICS, which are well accepted and 
broadly understood; it would develop and evolve 
concepts as needed. Doctrinal concepts created in this 
system would be incorporated into planning at each 
level in part because the stakeholders help to develop 
them. The system could further ensure this by includ-
ing procedures for linking local, state, and federal 
plans, planning cycles and processes, and for integrat-
ing plans of other stakeholders into federal planning. 
This will require more than a new process—it will re-
quire a doctrinally-based awareness that the federal 
government must (in most cases) lead by supporting. 
It will require federal response plans that support and 
integrate those of the states and other participants in 
the process. 

A national doctrine system must go beyond con-
cept development and integration of plans. Doctrinal 
concepts, plans, and capabilities must be rigorously 
tested with realistic training and exercises, conducted 
under consistent standards relying on objective data 
collection, and combined with painstaking analysis of 
actual, “real world” operations. Validation of doctrine 
should include a national homeland response training 
center system, with its main “training aid” being an 
actual mock-up of a small city.28 This unfortunate city 
would be routinely threatened by natural disasters, 
assaulted by imaginative domestic and foreign ter-
rorists, subject to industrial accidents, and bathed in 
pandemic diseases. It would host a diverse array of 
participants drawn from the federal interagency, state 
and local governments, and other relevant partners. A 
full-scale national training center would be a proving 
ground for developing doctrinal concepts that can be 
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replicated, trained, improved, adapted, and applied 
in jurisdictions, agencies, and organizations across the 
nation. It should link multiple elements and smaller 
regional centers in virtual space to provide tailored 
and multiechelon training across agencies, jurisdic-
tions, and responsibilities. Senior leaders of federal, 
state, and local government would interact with news 
media, industry, and private organizations while di-
recting and managing actual responders operating in 
realistic conditions. The system should be robustly 
instrumented and staffed to gather data for analysis, 
dissemination, and doctrinal development. The re-
sult would be better response elements, led by better 
trained and more capable leaders—in particular those 
senior leaders responsible for achieving unified effort 
across jurisdictions and response functions. Doctrinal 
concepts would be validated, improved, or rejected. 
Results would be passed into a feedback loop which 
would provide the basis for improvements in train-
ing, organization, equipment, and in the evolution of 
homeland response doctrine and capabilities. 

The “integrated planning system” envisioned in 
HSPD-8 is important, and if fully implemented could 
certainly improve unity of effort. But, we should not 
focus solely on plans, which can and should change. 
Plans and planning are vitally important, but a nation-
al doctrine is larger than the plans it produces. Consis-
tent unity of effort will grow out of a culture of coop-
eration and collaboration, which can be fostered by a 
national doctrine system. Plans specify ways of doing 
things, but doctrine begins with ways of thinking and 
understanding—these should precede and drive plan-
ning. A national homeland response doctrine system 
would integrate all stakeholders in the evolutionary 
process of how we think about and understand chal-
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lenges to safety and security at home, and collabora-
tively develop responses to them. It takes a great deal 
of time and effort to create an operational culture that 
fosters unity of effort. The example of our military’s 
organizational evolution from the National Defense 
Reorganization Act of 1947, to the Goldwater-Nichols 
Act of 1986, to the present day, is instructive in this 
respect. Developing a culture of collaboration and 
cooperation for homeland response will not occur 
overnight, but rather as the long-term result of patient 
development and continuous improvement.

A New Management Construct.

A second way to achieve unity of effort is to im-
prove our management capabilities. With the advent 
of a dynamic national homeland response doctrinal 
system, we will need to develop a new management 
structure that will operate in the spaces between agen-
cies and organizations. The NRF and ICS identify uni-
fied command as a key principle for effective incident 
management, but it is a temporary, incident-specific 
creation rather than a permanent one. Unity of com-
mand can be temporarily achieved in any incident, 
but cannot be permanently maintained, nor would we 
want it to be, in a system based on graduated response 
and shared responsibility. What we want to do, both 
within the scope of a single incident and as an ongoing 
factor in planning and preparation, is to establish and 
sustain unified effort. Day to day, our departments 
and agencies do not work together, yet in a crisis, they 
must. A national doctrine will provide the basis for 
effectively working together by establishing the intel-
lectual pre-conditions for cooperation, collaboration, 
communication, and coordination. However, given 
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the breadth and scope of what is to be implemented, a 
new management construct must also be created, one 
that works to bridge the divides within the homeland 
response community before, during, and after inci-
dents. It must foster unified effort across the doctrine 
development cycle, throughout planning and plan in-
tegration, and in training, organizing, and equipping 
response capabilities. The national homeland response 
doctrine system will function in an interagency, in-
tergovernmental, multijurisdictional environment. 
Implementing it requires a permanent management 
structure that will similarly operate in the gaps be-
tween agencies and governments. Here too, the expe-
rience of our military provides an example that points 
in the direction homeland response must go: the Joint 
Interagency Task Force, or JIATF. 

Joint military doctrine for civil support has recog-
nized the need for interagency planning and coordi-
nation for a number of years. This doctrine described 
an Interagency Planning Cell (IPC) that is “activated 
upon receipt of the . . . warning or alert order, or at the 
direction of the combatant commander” in response 
to a domestic disaster. This ad hoc entity was tailored 
to the crisis and set up to “rapidly advise the sup-
ported combatant commander about the resources of 
other agencies in the relief effort.” The concept was 
developed to facilitate “coherent and efficient plan-
ning and coordination effort through the participation 
of interagency subject matter experts, [and to lighten 
the] burden of coordination at the JTF level.”29 In this 
way, the IPC functioned similarly to the interagency 
Catastrophic Disaster Response Group (CDRG) called 
for under the Federal Emergency Management Agen-
cy (FEMA) doctrine. A CDRG “convenes . . . when 
needed” at the headquarters of the Department of 
Homeland Security (DHS). Comprised of representa-
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tives from various federal agencies, the CDRG is set 
up to “provide guidance and policy direction on coor-
dination and operational issues.”30 Such interagency 
coordination entities are important, but both the IPC 
and CDRG—and similar ad hoc organizations—are 
temporary. 

More recently, joint military doctrine has promul-
gated the concept of a standing JIACG. The JIACG 
is a permanent planning and coordination element. 
Described as “an element of a [geographic combatant 
commander’s] staff,” the JIACG “is an interagency 
staff group that establishes and enhances regular, 
timely, and collaborative working relationships be-
tween other governmental agencies’ representatives 
and military operational planners.” The JIACG is 
established at the discretion of the combatant com-
mander to “complement the interagency coordina-
tion that occurs at the national level through the DoD 
and the NSC [National Security Council] and HSC 
[Homeland Security Council] systems.” Its members 
“participate in contingency, crisis action, and security 
cooperation planning, [and] provide a conduit back to 
their parent organizations.”31 This helps synchronize 
joint operations—of the combatant command—with 
the efforts of other government agencies. As a more 
permanent element, the JIACG is an improvement 
over the IPC and CDRG. Yet it is still optional and, 
more importantly, an adjunct to military planning and 
operations. It incorporates other federal agencies and 
even nongovernmental organizations (NGOs) and 
inter-governmental organizations (IGOs), but these 
function under military direction, to support military 
needs.

A more germane example is provided by JIATF-
South. Established more than 2 decades ago to coor-
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dinate military and interagency efforts to combat the 
international narcotics trade, JIATF-South has built a 
strong reputation for success. Although established 
under authority of the National Defense Authoriza-
tion Act of 1989 and still nominally a military entity, 
JIATF-South is much more a multiservice, multiagen-
cy national task force. A key element in this entity is 
the integration of participating agencies in command 
and leadership posts. It is led by a Coast Guard ad-
miral, with a deputy director from the Customs and 
Border Patrol (CPB). It integrates senior leaders from 
various federal agencies into its leadership structure 
at lower levels as well: the senior intelligence and op-
erations directors are military officers, but their depu-
ties come from the Drug Enforcement Administration 
(DEA) and the CPB. In routine operations, “it is not 
uncommon to see a CBP agent serving as command 
duty officer, an Air Force captain as the intelligence 
watch officer, a Coast Guard operations specialist as 
the intelligence watch assistant, and a Navy lieuten-
ant as the tactical action officer.”32 JIATF-South in-
corporates multiple agencies into its intelligence op-
erations, effectively sharing information drawn from 
the resources of its members. It also includes inter-
national liaisons. The joint service, multiagency, and 
international structure enables it to quickly develop 
and share fused operational information, task assets 
under the control of the combatant commander, and 
coordinate the efforts of other assets under the control 
of participating agencies and international partners. 
While there is little formal military doctrine about 
what a JIATF is and should do—and virtually none 
among other participating agencies—the record of 
JIATF-South demonstrates that the concept works. As 
joint doctrine evolves, it will only strengthen and ex-
pand the potential of the JIATF.
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There have been recent calls to establish JIATF-
like entities for homeland response operations. For 
example, a recent advisory panel recommended for-
mation of a JIATF for incidents involving chemical, 
biological, radiological, nuclear, or high-yield explo-
sive (CBRNE) weapons, to facilitate “pre-incident 
planning and coordination” and rapidly “translate 
national-level decisionmaking for a CBRNE incident 
into operational and tactical actions.”33 Such ideas sug-
gest an emerging consensus that the JIATF construct 
has utility in homeland response operations. Yet this 
and similar ideas, and the structure of even highly 
successful JIATFs like JIATF-South, are too narrowly 
construed at present. This interagency coordinating 
structure cannot, for example, be an adjunct of U.S. 
Northern Command (NORTHCOM). NORTHCOM 
has a role to play, with important lead responsibilities 
for homeland defense and support responsibilities for 
other homeland security and civil support operations. 
However, the structure that is needed cannot be sub-
ordinate to any particular federal agency or depart-
ment—it must belong to and support them all. It must 
begin as a broadly held doctrinal concept, and be-
come more robust through expansion of its potential. 
A standing JIATF-like interagency coordination and 
action group—an “ICAG” perhaps—should be estab-
lished at the national level to integrate the planning, 
resourcing, and management of homeland response 
operations. It should reflect a common doctrinal un-
derstanding for a multi-participant entity operating 
in the spaces between agencies. As such, it cannot be 
a military structure, although it will certainly contain 
military elements. By the same token, it cannot be a 
creature of any other single agency or department 
head. The ICAG could rely on a lead agency for sup-
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space, it must draw on the capabilities and strengths 
of all relevant participants. 

This model clearly has a similar application for 
the states. Each has a vigorous interagency commu-
nity that is relevant to its own disaster planning and 
response efforts. If a federal ICAG would work to en-
hance unity of effort across the federal interagency, so 
too would a set of state-level ICAGs, accredited to each 
governor, perform the same useful function. One need 
not be overly prescriptive about the ICAG structure—
the senior leader it serves should be free to tailor and 
employ it as suits the needs of his agencies and con-
stituencies. As it evolves, the doctrinal concept might 
include narrow functional versions (e.g., an ICAG 
for national CBRNE response), as well as geographi-
cally based and broadly responsive ones—much as 
we have geographic and functional commands within 
our military to address different types of problems 
and responsibilities. In any case, some functions and 
characteristics should be common to all. These would 
include:

•	� Accreditation to a senior executive with author-
ity over the interagency construct being coordi-
nated, and accountable to the citizens served by 
the participating agencies and organizations;

•	� An integrated leadership structure that fosters 
full involvement by all participating agencies;

•	� Authority to task some assets useful to its rou-
tine work; and to coordinate for swift access 
to other assets that ought to be available when 
needed;

•	� Interagency analysis, fusion, and dissemina-
tion of relevant intelligence and operational 
information;

26
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•	� Fair sharing of responsibilities for resourcing, 
staffing, and support; and even-handed treat-
ment of the metrics of success for all partici-
pants;

•	� Ongoing coordination, communication, and 
collaboration between agencies served by the 
ICAG, as well as with the ICAGs of other states 
and the federal government.

Additional capabilities could be built into the 
ICAG concept. Over time, it would mature within the 
national homeland response doctrine; as governments 
at each level discover what works best, this informa-
tion will be fed back into the doctrinal cycle to improve 
it. But regardless of how the ICAG is structured in 
each specific instance, it will operate with overarching 
responsibility, day in and day out, to be the integrat-
ing structure for all interagency participants, ensuring 
unity of effort in planning and operations.

Unity of Effort across the Military. 

A third way to increase unity of effort is to im-
prove our ability to employ all relevant military forces 
and functions in the full range of homeland response 
operations. Although its primary responsibility is de-
fense against foreign threats, our military has taken on 
a wide range of other tasks in recent history, including 
nation-building,34 stability operations,35 and civil sup-
port.36 Regarding the latter, the 2008 Commission on 
the National Guard and Reserves (CNGR) final report 
included a number of significant findings—among 
them, that DoD fails to put adequate effort (planning, 
programming, and budgeting) into civil support capa-
bilities, and “historically has not made civil support a 
priority.”37 
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It is somewhat ironic that our military would place 
less emphasis on support for civil authority at home, 
even as they have very successfully executed peace-
keeping and stability operations abroad. In recent de-
cades, both unilaterally and within multinational co-
alitions, our forces have routinely been the only entity 
capable of providing security and stability, preserving 
life and property, delivering medical care, and assist-
ing in the restoration of civil institutions. Yet aside 
from National Guard operations, DoD has been re-
luctant to engage in civil support operations at home, 
and perhaps understandably so. There is substantial 
primary capability in our nation, at many levels, for 
disaster planning and response; state and local leaders 
are quite rightly held to account for their performance 
in this area. Yet the CNGR report recommends that 
Congress mandate civil support as a primary mission 
for DoD, “equal in priority to its combat responsibili-
ties.”38 

The reason for this is plain: our military possesses 
a variety of capabilities with great value in respond-
ing to disasters and mitigating their effects; Americans 
expect that the military resources they paid for will 
be available when needed to protect them. It makes 
little difference to the injured, hungry, and dispos-
sessed that the cause of their misery is a hurricane, a 
pandemic, an industrial disaster, or a terrorist strike. 
Their reasonable expectation is that “the government” 
will provide for public safety in their hour of need. 
For this reason, we should be removing impediments 
to unity of effort in utilizing our military forces, and 
our reserve components in particular, for homeland 
response operations when they are not engaged in 
federal missions overseas.
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There are clear legal restrictions on the roles and 
uses of our military at home, which exist for sound 
reasons that need not be debated here.39 It is sufficient 
to note that our forefathers wisely saw the problems 
inherent to employing military forces in roles normal-
ly confined to civil authority. However, the principal 
challenge in employing our military for homeland 
response is not a constitutional issue, but rather one 
of lesser law. The role of the federal government in 
raising, supporting, and employing military forces for 
both overseas missions and in various roles at home 
is clearly established, as is its ability to federalize Na-
tional Guard units when needed. What is not well 
settled—but must be—is the ability of our governors 
to swiftly and seamlessly employ all the capabilities 
that might be made available to them when needed. 
This includes employment of military capabilities; it 
is critical to a governor’s ability to formulate complete 
and well-coordinated homeland response plans with 
confidence. The status of most forces under Title 10 
currently precludes placing them under state author-
ity. This includes all DoD reserve components other 
than the National Guard and the active components 
of all services. 

Most of our military capabilities are organized and 
resourced for federal service, as it ought to be. Yet 
some (the National Guard) are available for local and 
state missions. From a governor’s standpoint, nothing 
could be easier or more efficient than having all the 
available military forces in his state operate under his 
control when not needed for federal missions. There 
are sound reasons why this is not so, and our pres-
ent system—despite the Title 10/Title 32 divide—has 
served reasonably well over time in providing ready 
forces for federal missions. Certainly, no one could 
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claim that National Guard forces have been less ready 
or available for service overseas since September 2001 
than their Title 10 counterparts because they were 
tasked with state missions. In fact, quite the opposite 
is true. The example of the governor of Louisiana do-
ing without thousands of that state’s National Guard 
soldiers who were deployed to Iraq during Hurricane 
Katrina simply underscores the point that when the 
nation is at war, our military forces are at the federal 
government’s direction. What has become increasing-
ly clear since 9/11 is that state and local jurisdictions 
have a vital role to play in the full range of homeland 
response operations, including preventing and re-
sponding to terrorism. Given this reality, how might 
we reorganize to broaden the base of military capabili-
ties available to them?

The CNGR made several recommendations to 
improve military support for homeland response. It 
recognized the value of new capabilities (such as Na-
tional Guard homeland response elements), as well as 
other military units which are “dual-capable forces.”40 
Not all military forces have a value in civil support 
operations. Some have more obvious uses than others, 
but many are, in fact, dual-capable. This includes not 
only National Guard, but Title 10 active and reserve 
forces as well. These elements have routinely served 
in peacekeeping and stability operations overseas and 
occasionally in support of civil authority at home, per-
forming tasks which are not the ones for which they 
were originally organized, trained, and equipped. 
Simply put, our military can do more than just fight 
our nation’s wars. From the birth of the republic to the 
present day, our National Guard—and on occasion, 
our Title 10 forces—have proven the value of dual-
capable military forces.
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Achieving unity of effort for homeland response 
among our military services is neither a matter of 
determining which forces ought to be in the Nation-
al Guard and which should not, nor one of simply 
combining National Guard and Reserve structures 
(an argument which begs the point). Rather, it is one 
of determining when and how to best place military 
forces under a governor’s authority to make them 
readily available for civil support roles. Toward this 
end, we should be removing impediments to train-
ing, planning for, and employing military units un-
der the direction of a governor. A pre-qualified dual 
status commander would have authority to direct and 
coordinate the efforts of all military forces acting in 
support of the governor (or the governors) of affected 
states and territories. These officers are senior military 
leaders trained and selected in advance for their ex-
pertise and local knowledge. This positions them well 
to plan for the utilization of available military assets in 
their regions. Dual status command has been success-
fully employed in recent years for pre-planned joint 
and multiagency civil support events such as the 2004 
G8 Summit, nominating conventions, and border con-
trol operations.41 It makes sense for the military lead-
ers with the most local knowledge and experience to 
lead defense support of civil authority in their areas of 
responsibility. Dual status command works. It should 
be the rule, not the exception; and better methods 
must be developed for placing useful military capa-
bilities under dual status command, when requested 
and if available, for homeland response. This means 
developing better advance planning and implemen-
tation procedures for dual status command, such as 
has been proposed by the Council of Governors.42 This 
should include the full range of “no notice” homeland 
response disaster events.
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We must also make all relevant military capabilities 
available for homeland response in a way that facili-
tates effective planning. The services have developed 
procedures for identification and rotation of forces 
to support overseas deployments, such as the Army 
Force Generation (ARFORGEN) model. This system is 
a “rotational readiness model” which provides “stra-
tegic flexibility to meet security requirements for a 
continuous presence of deployed forces.”43 Such a sys-
tem could be adapted to identify capabilities available 
for civil support operations in a similar way—a civil 
support force generation cycle—to ensure that those 
who plan for civil support by DoD assets have a pre-
dictable way to obtain needed capabilities to support 
those plans and contingencies. This would facilitate 
early identification and training of units and capabili-
ties—active and reserve—for civil support task pro-
ficiency as they rotate into the pool of available ele-
ments; and it could be nuanced to complement and 
support the demands of federal missions overseas. 
With a predictable system for force generation, gover-
nors and dual status commanders would be in a bet-
ter position to plan for, request, and employ available 
military capabilities when they are needed. 

Unity of Effort.

The greatest challenge in homeland response op-
erations is creating unity of effort. Many essential 
capabilities are spread across multiple jurisdictions, 
agencies, and organizations. This patchwork of au-
thority, responsibility, and capability reflects our vi-
brant democratic system, yet it is these same divides 
that makes unity of effort so difficult. Most of the time, 
we want these seams in our system. We prefer to deal 
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with governments close to home, accessible and re-
sponsive to most of our routine needs. In times of cri-
sis, we do not want federal authority to replace state 
and local authority. But we do want our governments 
to work together, to use assets and capabilities that are 
already available in coordinated and thoughtful ways 
to ensure the public safety. When necessary, we want 
federal assets to complement and complete—not com-
pete with—our local and state efforts in a seamless, 
unified response.

This requires a new approach. It requires us to 
foster a culture of communication, coordination, col-
laboration, and cooperation among the many entities 
that have a role in homeland response operations. To 
be able to act with unity and decision, we must be able 
to plan, train, resource, and prepare for unified effort. 
This begins with how we think about homeland re-
sponse, and each participant’s role in it. A truly unify-
ing national doctrine that stresses these tenets, devel-
oped and dynamically updated in an inclusive system, 
will break down barriers to effectiveness and remove 
impediments to unity of effort in times of crisis. To 
implement a national doctrine across the divides in 
our system, we need new management concepts that 
work between and among all participants, such as the 
proposed interagency coordination and action group. 
This element will integrate and synthesize the efforts 
of all stakeholders, working in the spaces between to 
stitch together the jurisdictional patchwork into a us-
able blanket of protection. We must remove all barri-
ers that currently exist to full utilization of relevant 
military capabilities for homeland response. This can 
be accomplished by making forces available to our 
governors when and where they are needed, return-
ing them to the nation when the crisis is past; and by 
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providing reliable processes to plan for their readiness 
and availability before disaster strikes. 

Achieving unity of effort in homeland response is 
a complex challenge, among the greatest of our age. 
It is the single most important factor in our ability to 
plan for and respond effectively to disasters in our 
homeland. We devote enormous resources to public 
safety and security at many levels. Our citizens surely 
have a right to expect that these resources will be well 
used by their leaders, elected and appointed. This 
means that we must find better ways to work togeth-
er. It requires leaders and organizations at all levels 
to combine their efforts, resources, and capabilities to 
achieve responsive and complete solutions. John Jay 
observed in the Federalist Papers No. 3 that “among the 
many objects to which a wise and free people find it 
necessary to direct their attention, that of providing 
for their safety seems to be the first.”44 There cannot 
be any higher priority for government than ensuring 
the safety of its citizens. This is a serious issue, deserv-
ing a serious approach. National security begins with 
homeland security, and homeland security depends 
fundamentally on our ability to work together, to 
bring our enormous capacity to bear at the right time, 
the right place, and in the right measure. Americans 
have long and proud traditions both of celebrating 
our differences, and of joining together in adversity to 
achieve common purposes. We should not allow any 
of the routinely divisive factors prevent us from work-
ing together effectively in times of crisis.
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